
DISTRICT COURT 
BOULDER COUNTY, COLORADO 
20th Judicial District Court 
Boulder County Justice Center 
1777 Sixth Street, P.O. Box 4249 
Boulder, CO 80306 
303-441-3750

______________________________________________ 

In re the Marriage of: 
Petitioner: CHARLES BELL 
and 
Co-Petitioner: ALYSON BELL         COURT USE ONLY 

Carol Glassman, #11321 
Carol Glassman, P.C. 
4845 Pearl E. Circle, Suite 101 
Boulder, CO  80301 
Telephone:  303-442-1403 
E-Mail: carol@carolglassman.com

Nelissa Milfeld, #40753 
Milfeld Law LLC 
1650 38th Street, Suite 302E 
Boulder, CO  80301 
Telephone:  303-990-1953 
Email:  milfeldlaw@gmail.com 

Case Number:  2022DR30458 

Division:  12 

1BCO-PETITIONER’S COUNSEL’S AFFIDAVIT FOR ATTORNEY FEES AND 
COSTS RELATED TO PETITIONER’S VERIFIED MOTION TO MODIFY 

SPOUSAL MAINTENANCE AND CHILD SUPPORT 

COME NOW counsel for Co-Petitioner, Alyson Bell, Carol Glassman, Carol Glassman, 

P.C. and Nelissa Milfeld, Milfeld Law, LLC and hereby submit an Affidavit reflecting

Co-Petitioner’s attorney fees and costs from September 22, 2024 to May 25, 2025, as follows: 

1. Carol Glassman is an attorney duly licensed to practice law in the State of Colorado

with registration number 11321.  Co-counsel, Nelissa Milfeld, is an attorney duly licensed to 
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practice law in the State of Colorado with registration number 40753. 

2. Carol Glassman was retained to represent Co-Petitioner at the billable rate of $400 

per hour for her time, $325 for Ms. Milfeld’s time, $175 per hour for paralegal time, and $65 per 

hour for legal secretarial time, plus fees and costs.  These rates are reasonable and customary 

(Ms. Glassman’s current rate is $450 per hour) in this community for the type of services provided 

and the experience of counsel.   

3. From September 22, 2024 through May 25, 2025, the attorney fees, including 

paralegal and legal secretarial time were $53,268. 

4. From September 22, 2024 through May 25, 2025, Co-Petitioner has incurred $2,262 

in costs.  Co-Petitioner incurred an additional $4,371 in costs for Mr. Freedberg’s services. 

5. From September 22, 2024 through May 25, 2025, Co-Petitioner has incurred a total 

of $55,530 in fees and costs. 

6. From May 26, 2025 through the date of the hearing on Petitioner’s Verified Motion 

to Modify Spousal Maintenance and Child Support (“Modification Hearing”), attorney will spend 

additional time preparing for and attending the Modification Hearing scheduled June 11, 2025 at 

9:00 AM. Additional hearing costs will be incurred. An additional Affidavit for Attorney Fees will 

be submitted from May 26, 2025 through the Modification Hearing if requested by the Court. 

7. A copy of the itemized breakdown of the billing from September 22, 2024 through 

May 25, 2025 is attached and incorporated herein.   

 WHEREFORE, counsel request that this Honorable Court find that their fees and costs 

incurred as set forth above are reasonable and necessary under the circumstances of this case. 
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Dated:  May 30, 2025 Respectfully submitted, 
CAROL GLASSMAN, P.C. 
 
/s/Carol Glassman    
Carol Glassman, No. 11321 
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CAROL GLASSMAN, P.C. 
4845 PEARL E. CIRCLE, SUITE 101 

BOULDER, CO 80301 
(303) 442-1403 

ALYSON BELL 
AL YSONVARVELBELL@GMAIL.COM 

MAY25, 2025 
CLIENT CODE: 1411.01 

MATTER: DISSOLUTION 

----01/14/25 
02/16/25 
04/09/25 
04/30/25 

Payment Received - Thank You 
Payment Received - Thank You 
Payment Received - Thank You 
Payment Received - Thank You 

-------250.00 
-250.00 
-250.00 
-500.00 

----­
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES - MAINTENANCE AND CHILD SUPPORT MODIFICATION ONLY 

EMP 

September 22, 2024 

DESCRIPTION 

CEG 

CEG 

Read Motion to Modify Maintenance and Child Support; Instructions to paralegal 

Telephone conference with Ms. Milfeld regarding Motion to Modify 

September 23, 2024 

ML 

CEG 

Update client pleading file; Calendar Response deadline to Motion to Modify 
Maintenance; Forward Order regarding Stipulation Regarding Attorney Fees to 
Alyson. 

Email to Alyson with Motion and request for updated financial information 

September 24, 2024 

ML 

NM 

Finalize and e-file Motion to Strike Charles' Motion to Modify Spousal Support; 
Index in client file; Forward to Alyson. 

Finalize Motion to Strike 

HOURS 

0.40 

0.50 

0.25 

0.35 

0.25 

0.10 
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

CEG  Read client's email; Review Motion to Strike 0.35  

CEG Draft Order 0.20  

September 30, 2024

CEG Telephone conference with Alyson 0.65  

October 2, 2024

NM Review Petitioner's Motion to Modify; Review Response to Motion to Strike 1.10  

NM Draft Response to Motion to Modify Maintenance and Child Support 1.50  

October 3, 2024

CEG Review first draft of Response to Motion to Modify Maintenance and Child Support 0.20  

NM Review In re Marriage of Nelson regarding Modification of Maintenance 0.50  

NM Continue drafting Response to Motion to Modify Maintenance Vol. I 1.00  

October 9, 2024

ML Index Order Re Motion to Strike Motion to Modify in client file; Calendar 0.20  
deadlines.

ML Finalize Response to Motion to Modify Spousal Maintenance; E-file with the Court; 0.30  
Calendar Reply deadline; Index in client file.

CEG Review court order; Review calendar with paralegal; Email to Alyson; Email to Katy 0.80  
Ellis; Revise Response; Instructions to paralegal regarding filing

October 14, 2024

ML Create Dropbox post-decree C.R.C.P. 16.2 financial disclosures for Alyson 0.15  

October 17, 2024

ML Index Reply to Response to Motion to Modify Maintenance in client file; Forward to 0.25  
Alyson

CEG Read Reply to Response; Read Case Management Order; Email to clerk regarding 0.50  
deadlines
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

October 22, 2024

ML Upload, review, and organize C.R.C.P. 16.2 financial disclosures received from 0.80  
Alyson in Dropbox; Format first draft of Certificate of Compliance

October 28, 2024

ML Review Dropbox regarding C.R.C.P. 16.2 financial disclosures 0.25  

ML Review Sworn Financial Statement provided by Alyson; Format first draft of 0.50  
Post-Decree Sworn Financial Statement

October 29, 2024

CEG Meeting with paralegal regarding disclosures 0.10  

October 30, 2024

ML Continue review of Sworn Financial Statement 0.40  

November 3, 2024

CEG Review Alyson's CRCP 16.2 disclosures; Instructions to paralegal 1.25  

November 4, 2024

ML Review Alyson’s Permanent Orders Sworn Financial Statement with CEG. 0.25  

CEG Email to Alyson with questions and requests regarding CRCP 16.2 disclosures 0.35  

CEG Read email from court clerk; Instructions to paralegal 0.20  

November 5, 2024

ML Revise Sworn Financial Statement 0.25  

November 12, 2024

ML Read Alyson’s email regarding 16.2 disclosures; Save documents; Revise 0.40  
Certificate of Compliance

CEG Respond to email regarding mediation 0.10  

November 13, 2024

CEG Emails regarding mediation setting 0.20  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

CEG Review Alyson's responses and updated materials for CRCP 16.2 disclosures 0.75  

November 15, 2024

CEG Telephone conference with Alyson; Review additional documents; Instructions to 0.75  
paralegal

CEG Review next draft of changes with paralegal; Email to Alyson 0.75  

ML Review Sworn Financial Statement with CEG 0.75  

November 18, 2024

ML Review Alyson’s email; Continue financial disclosures 0.30  

CEG Met with paralegal; Review revisions to Sworn Financial Statement and Certificate 0.30  
of Compliance

November 20, 2024

ML Finalize Sworn Financial Statement and Certificate of Compliance; Emails with 0.50  
Alyson; Forward documents to Alyson for electronic signatures (.2); E-file with
the Court; Index in client file; Forward to Alyson (.25)

ML Index Charles’ Sworn Financial Statement and Certificate of Compliance in client 1.25  
file; Review pleadings and supporting documents; Index in client file

CEG Review instructions to paralegal, Merrill Lynch statement 0.20  

November 21, 2024

ML Upload Charles C.R.C.P. 16.2 financial disclosures into Dropbox; Forward to 0.20  
Alyson.

November 24, 2024

CEG Start review of Charles' disclosures 0.40  

November 25, 2024

ML Forward Post-Decree Motions to J. Freedberg. 0.10  

November 26, 2024

ML Complete Confidential Mediation Statement with CEG; Compile attachments; Open 2.40  
Dropbox folder for P. Goodbody; Draft email to P. Goodbody.
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

CEG Telephone call to Katy; Draft Confidential Mediation Statement; Emails to Alyson 2.50  
and Jay

November 27, 2024

NM Edit Confidential Mediation Statement 0.60  

CEG Review revisions; Email to Peggy with mediation materials 0.35  

December 1, 2024

CEG Email to Jay regarding requests; Instructions to paralegal regarding discovery; 1.50  
Review pleadings and requests for mediation

December 2, 2024

CEG Emails; Document request email to Katy; Email to Goodbody with Littman order 0.65  
excerpt; Emails with paralegal regarding mediation

CEG Read and respond to emails regarding postponement of mediation 0.25  

CEG Attend mediation 1.25  

CEG Draft Status Report and request for extension of time for mediation 0.50  

CEG Read certificate of mediation; Instructions to paralegal 0.20  

ML Format Co-Petitioner’s Status Report 0.20  

December 3, 2024

CEG Instructions to paralegal regarding discovery; Email to N. Milfeld regarding focus 0.40  
of non-pattern discovery

CEG Telephone conference with J. Freedberg 0.35  

CEG Email 0.10  

CEG Telephone conference with Alyson 0.25  

ML Search Permanent Orders for reference to Alyson’s role as bookkeeper; Save and 0.35  
rename documents Charles’ presented at mediation; Forward to N. Milfeld and J.
Freedberg.

ML Format first draft of discovery requests to Charles; Forward to N. Milfeld for 0.25  
drafting of Non-Pattern requests.
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

December 4, 2024

CEG Instructions to paralegal regarding delivered documents; Email to Nelissa Milfeld 0.20  
regarding discovery

CEG Read email with documents provided and requests; Meeting with paralegal 0.35  
regarding same

ML Read Alyson’s email regarding gross salary; Adjust Sworn Financial Statement; 0.15  
Save 2023 W-2 in client file.

ML Review email from J. Thacher; Review, download, rename, and organize 1.20  
documents provided into client file and Dropbox; Review produced documents for
deficiencies to CEG’s requests; Format email to opposing counsel regarding
deficiencies for CEG review.

ML Chart Charles’ job search efforts 0.25  

December 5, 2024

CEG Meeting with paralegal regarding requested documents from Alyson and 0.50  
documents that were received

CEG Revise email to Jason regarding deficiencies; Email 0.35  

ML Review documents provided by Charles regarding Jay’s request. 0.35  

December 6, 2024

CEG Telephone conference with J. Freedberg 0.35  

December 7, 2024

CEG Read email from Alyson regarding production of documents; Instructions to 0.20  
paralegal

NM Review email correspondence regarding discovery; Review motion regarding 1.50  
discovery; Draft non-pattern questions and Request for Production of Documents

December 8, 2024

CEG Review first set of discovery 0.20  

NM Finalize interrogatory/production of document responses 0.40  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

December 9, 2024

CEG Meeting with paralegal; Email to Alyson; Email with Freedberg; Prepare email to 0.50  
Opposing Counsel with documents

ML Read Alyson’s email regarding document requests from Opposing Counsel; Review 0.30  
documents provided by Alyson

December 10, 2024

CEG Telephone conference regarding discovery 0.40  

CEG Final review of discovery requests; Draft Medical Release; Instructions to 0.40  
paralegal

CEG Review Alyson's responses to Opposing Counsel's requests 0.50  

ML Download, rename, organize and inventory discovery request deficiencies; Save 1.50  
Vol. 2 discovery requests to Charles

ML Review discovery requests to Charles with CEG; Finalize and e-serve with the 0.30  
Court.

December 11, 2024

ML Read Alyson’s email; Save attached documents in client file. 0.15  

ML Format first draft of Alyson’s Post-Decree First Supplemental Certificate of 0.25  
Compliance; Draft email to Opposing Counsel regarding same.

December 12, 2024

CEG Review documents from client 0.20  

CEG Instructions to paralegal regarding new documents received 0.30  

December 17, 2024

ML Save and review Charles’ documents received by Opposing Counsel 0.75  

December 18, 2024

ML Email regarding Charles’ documents received by Opposing Counsel 0.10  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

December 20, 2024

CEG Read email and client's response 0.10  

December 22, 2024

CEG Email to Ms. Milfeld; Read email from Jay 0.35  

December 23, 2024

NM Telephone conference with Mr. Thatcher regarding Bell issues 0.30  

CEG Read and respond to email from paralegal 0.25  

December 30, 2024

CEG Telephone conference 0.40  

CEG Email exchange with Thacher 0.20  

January 3, 2025

CEG Read Alyson's responses to questions 0.10  

January 10, 2025

CEG Read email from Thatcher 0.10  

CEG Email to Nelissa regarding mediation 0.20  

January 14, 2025

CEG Read and respond to emails from Thatcher 0.10  

January 16, 2025

CEG Telephone conference 0.20  

January 19, 2025

CEG Read Reply and 10 exhibits; Instructions to paralegal 0.90  

January 28, 2025

CEG Telephone conference 0.20  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

January 31, 2025

CEG Read email from Thatcher regarding discovery; Respond to same; Instructions to 0.25  
paralegal

February 4, 2025

ML Email to J. Thacher regarding Charles’ discovery responses; Read J. Thacher’s 0.10  
response; Forward to CEG

CEG Instructions to paralegal regarding Charles' discovery responses 0.20  

February 5, 2025

ML Download and review Charles’ discovery responses 2.70  

February 6, 2025

ML Continue review of Charles’ discovery responses 1.25  

ML Download Charles’ discovery requests in client file; Calendar deadline for 0.40  
Alyson’s responses; Download responses to Alyson’s discovery in client file;
Compare e-served responses to responses sent via email from opposing counsel.

CEG Meeting with paralegal regarding Charles' discovery responses; Email to J. 0.75  
Thatcher regarding same; Read email from J. Thatcher and respond to same

February 10, 2025

ML Email to Alyson with Charles’ February 6, 2025 discovery responses and supporting 0.40  
documents; Save and print opposing counsel’s settlement offer; Set up emails to
Alyson from CEG regarding Charles’ discovery requests and settlement proposal;
Save and print opposing counsel’s settlement proposal; Print for CEG.

ML Format Responsive pleadings to Charles’ discovery requests to Alyson 0.50  

CEG Review settlement proposal; Email to Alyson regarding same 0.50  

CEG Review discovery requests from Charles; Email regarding same 0.40  

CEG Telephone conference 0.20  

February 11, 2025

CEG Start review of Charles' discovery responses 0.75  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

February 13, 2025

ML Update client pleading file with recently filed pleadings. 0.40  

ML Draft HIPPA releases for Charles’ medical providers 0.25  

CEG Meeting with paralegal 0.20  

CEG Continue review of Charles' discovery pleadings 0.35  

CEG Email to Alyson; Notice to Withdraw; Email to Thatcher with Releases; Start 0.75  
deficiency email

February 18, 2025

CEG Complete Charles' deficiency email regarding discovery responses 1.00  

ML Create Dropbox for Alyson’s discovery responses to Charles 0.10  

ML Review Charles’ discovery responses regarding documents and first draft of 1.00  
deficiency email to opposing counsel

February 19, 2025

ML Format first draft of Witness Disclosures 0.25  

ML Download Alyson’s discovery responses into client file 0.25  

February 20, 2025

ML Continue download, review, and input information into Alyson discovery responses 1.50  

February 23, 2025

NM Telephone conference with CEG regarding Interrogatories, report and Deposition 0.20  

CEG Review discovery requests and inserted Objections; Review documents provided; 1.50  
Instructions to paralegal

CEG Meeting with Ms. Milfeld 0.50  

CEG Review discovery responses 0.30  

February 24, 2025

ML Input Alyson’s discovery response objections per CEG instructions 0.40  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

CEG Telephone conference; Email exchange with Thatcher 0.50  

CEG Met with paralegal regarding discovery 0.50  

February 25, 2025

ML Review Alyson’s production of document responses 1.00  

CEG Email to Stephanie to clear hearing date; Email exchange with Jason regarding 0.90  
discovery deficiencies; Review objections to discovery with paralegal

CEG Emails with Alyson; Instructions to paralegal 0.20  

February 26, 2025

NM Revise Answers to Interrogatories and Request for Production of Documents 0.40  
Request

NM Review Mr. Bell's Answers to Interrogatories 0.50  

ML Continue Alyson’s production of document responses with respect to Alyson’s 0.50  
email

ML Zoom meeting with CEG and Alyson regarding status of appellate case and 1.00  
Alyson’s discovery responses.

ML Create Dropbox for delivery to C. Bell of Alyson’s discovery response documents. 0.25  

CEG Meeting with Alyson regarding discovery and pending matters 1.50  

CEG Review Ms. Milfeld edits and notes; Email to Alyson regarding same 0.30  

CEG Read Pleading regarding Motion to Withdraw; Instructions to Milfeld 0.30  

February 27, 2025

ML Index Order re Ex Parte hearing in client file 0.10  

CEG Emails to Alyson regarding Motion; Voice mail to Milfeld 0.35  

February 28, 2025

CEG Review pleading with Ms. Milfeld; Read Order from court regarding same 0.35  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

March 1, 2025

CEG Review pleadings from the court; Instructions to paralegal 0.30  

March 3, 2025

ML Update client pleading file 0.25  

March 4, 2025

ML Read J. Thatcher e-mail; Save HIPPA Medical Releases in client file. 0.10  

CEG Email to Nelissa with timeline for discovery Motion to Compel 0.20  

CEG Email to Thatcher regarding HIPPA releases; Instructions to paralegal regarding 0.20  
same

March 5, 2025

ML Format first draft of medical request letter to Charles’ medical providers; Leave 0.30  
voicemails at all medical providers requesting process of obtaining Charles’
medical records.

CEG Review Discovery Responses for Alyson's signatures; Instructions to paralegal 0.35  
regarding case deadlines

CEG Review letters to Charles' providers for records; Instructions to paralegal 0.20  

March 6, 2025

ML Update client file with pleadings filed by opposing counsel and Charles Bell with 0.25  
respect to March 6, 2026 Ex-Parte hearing.

ML Calendar Motion hearing deadlines in Outlook 0.25  

ML Finalize and send Alyson Responses to Interrogatories and Request for Production 0.20  
of Documents for e-signature

ML Save Alyson’s e-signed discovery requests; Finalize and upload in CCEF for 0.25  
filing

CEG Email to Alyson; Review Deadline chart for upcoming hearing 0.35  

March 9, 2025

CEG Draft Motion to Compel and Order 0.75  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

CEG Telephone conference 0.35  

March 11, 2025

ML Index recently filed pleadings in client file; Forward to Alyson. 0.30  

CEG Read emails and review attachments from Charles 0.50  

CEG Meeting 0.75  

CEG Telephone conference with Alyson 0.35  

March 12, 2025

CEG Telephone conference; Read and respond to email from Alyson 0.40  

March 13, 2025

ML Finalize Petitioner’s Motion to Compel and compile and mark exhibits; Upload 0.35  
Motion and exhibits to CCEF

CEG Telephone conference with Alyson 0.20  

CEG Final review of Motion to Compel and exhibits 0.25  

March 14, 2025

ML Index Charles’ Objection to Motion to Compel and exhibits in client file 0.20  

ML Review hearing deadlines with CEG 0.25  

CEG Read Charles' Motion and review Exhibits 1.00  

CEG Email to clerk regarding deadlines for responsive briefings 0.30  

CEG Set up Trial Management Certificate and witness examination folders 0.35  

March 17, 2025

ML Begin trial notebook folder for CEG 0.40  

March 20, 2025

CEG Meeting 0.75  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

March 27, 2025

CEG Read email from Charles; Review Dropbox tax documents; Telephone conference 0.75  
with Alyson; Instructions to paralegal

April 3, 2025

ML Contact Charles Bell’s providers that have not forwarded medical records, leave 0.25  
voicemail at each facility; Email providers with medical records request letter
and HIPPA release.

April 6, 2025

CEG Review Charles' email and attachments; Email to Alyson regarding same; Draft 2.50  
Co-Petitioner's Second Motion to Compel

CEG Telephone conference 0.35  

April 7, 2025

ML Save documents in client file 0.20  

ML Update client pleading file; Forward to Alyson. 0.40  

CEG Review Witness Disclosure 0.40  

CEG Read email from Charles regarding discovery 0.30  

April 8, 2025

CEG Start Outline for hearing 0.35  

April 9, 2025

ML Finalize and upload Alyson’s Witness Disclosures in CCEF; Review hearing 1.00  
deadlines with CEG; Instructions from CEG regarding pre-hearing tasks

ML Format first draft of pleading for Submission of Expert Report 0.20  

ML Format first draft of Exhibit List for Permanent Orders June 11, 2025 0.25  

ML Format first draft of Trial Management Certificate. 0.40  

CEG Read and respond to email from Charles regarding discovery; Instructions to 1.30  
paralegal; Review Witness Disclosures; Review Case Management Order; Review
current pleadings
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

CEG Telephone conferences 1.75  

CEG Email exchange with Charles regarding discovery and review additional responses 0.50  

April 10, 2025

CEG Read email from Charles with discovery responses; Email to Alyson 0.35  

April 11, 2025

CEG Telephone conference 1.30  

CEG Emails with Alyson 0.35  

April 13, 2025

CEG Retrieve income and health insurance documents for exhibits 0.35  

April 14, 2025

ML Save Charles’ Emails regarding discovery response deficiencies 0.10  

CEG Read Charles' additional discovery response; Meeting with paralegal regarding 0.75  
hearing tasks

CEG Read email from Charles; Telephone conference with Freedberg 0.25  

April 15, 2025

CEG Read Jay's report 0.75  

April 16, 2025

ML Continue Exhibit List for 6/11/25 hearing 0.20  

CEG Review Pleading; Draft email to clerk 1.00  

CEG Emails with Charles regarding Report; Check CCEF for verification for service 0.40  

ML E-serve Jay Freedberg's Report 0.20  

April 17, 2025

ML Index Notice filed by Charles in client file; Forward to Alyson. 0.20  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

April 21, 2025

CEG Start outline of testimony 0.60  

April 22, 2025

ML Compile trial exhibits with CEG 0.60  

ML Read Alyson’s email; Convert document to .pdf; Save exhibit for hearing. 0.10  

ML Continue compiling exhibits for modification hearing 0.50  

MAL Administrative assistant - Trial Management Certificate with CEG 1.25  

CEG First draft of Exhibit List 0.60  

CEG Read Motion in Limine 0.30  

CEG Start Trial Management Certificate 1.75  

April 23, 2025

ML Update client pleading file with recently filed Order from the Court; Set up 0.25  
Dropbox for modification updated statements; Send invite to Alyson.

CEG Email exchanges with Alyson; Hearing preparation; Read ruling from court 1.00  

April 24, 2025

ML Download statements and Sworn Financial Statement received from Alyson in 1.50  
Dropbox in client file; Organize and rename documents; Format first draft of Sworn
Financial Statement

April 27, 2025

CEG Hearing preparation 2.50  

April 28, 2025

MAL Administrative assistant - Transcribe additional Trial Management Certificate 1.00  
language with CEG

CEG Continue Trial Management Certificate 1.00  

CEG Review revised Sworn Financial Statement; Review revisions to Trial Management 0.50  
Certificate
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

April 29, 2025

MAL Administrative assistant - Transcribe additional Trial Management Certificate 0.50  
language with CEG

ML Format first draft of post decree modification hearing Certificate of Compliance 0.40  

ML Format first draft of Alyson’s Objections to Charles’ trial exhibits 0.20  

May 6, 2025

CEG Revisions to Trial Management Certificate 0.50  

ML Review Certificate of Compliance with CEG 0.50  

CEG Prepare Motion for Non-Joint Trial Management Certificates 1.50  

May 7, 2025

CEG Draft Order for Co-Petitioner's Motion for Non-Joint Trial Management 0.30  
Certificate

ML Finalize for filing Motion for Parties to Submit Non-Joint Trial Management 0.30  
Certificates and proposed Order; E-file with the Court; Calendar response
deadline; Index in client file

CEG Prepare Motion to Limit Filing by Petitioner 1.25  

May 8, 2025

CEG Meeting with Alyson 0.75  

CEG Meeting with paralegal 0.20  

ML Review Dropbox; Update Certificate of Compliance with updated statement 0.50  
received from Alyson

May 9, 2025

CEG Telephone conference with Jay 0.75  

CEG Draft of Trial Management Certificate 2.00  

CEG Review Petitioner's CRCP 16.2(e)(10) Motion 0.50  
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ALYSON BELL                             
DISSOLUTION
CLIENT CODE:  1411.01

EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

May 10, 2025

CEG Draft direct testimony 3.30  

May 12, 2025

MAL Administrative assistant - Transcribe Trial Management Certificate 0.60  

MAL Administrative assistant - Transcribe testimony 1.00  

ML Format first draft of Affidavit for Attorney Fees 0.25  

May 13, 2025

ML Email to Alyson; Download documents. 0.10  

MAL Administrative assistant - Administrative assistance to CEG including revisions to 1.25  
Trial Management Certificate and Affidavit for Attorney Fees

ML Continue review of Alyson’s modification hearing C.R.C.P. 16.2 financial 0.40  
disclosures.

CEG Read court order; Review changes to Trial Management Certificate; Emails with 1.75  
Alyson; Research

CEG Review commission income; Email to Alyson 0.25  

May 14, 2025

ML Organize exhibits 0.20  

MAL Administrative assistant - Typed revisions to Direct Testimony 0.75  

CEG Review testimony 0.75  

May 15, 2025

CEG Hearing preparation 1.50  

May 16, 2025

CEG Reply to Objection to Motion to Limit Filing 0.50  

May 18, 2025

CEG Hearing preparation 5.00  
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DISSOLUTION
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EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

CEG Read emails and pleading from C. Bell regarding supplemental discovery and court 0.35  
order regarding same

CEG Hearing preparation 2.00  

May 19, 2025

MAL Administrative assistant - Typed revisions to Direct Testimony 0.40  

MAL Administrative assistant - Typed Cross Examination 0.60  

ML Review Alyson’s supplemental discovery and supplemental 16.2 disclosures with 2.00  
CEG

ML Download updated statements from Alyson; Revise supplemental Certificate of 0.25  
Compliance

May 20, 2025

ML Download and forward recent pleadings filed/served with the Court 0.50  

MAL Administrative assistant - Typed testimony 0.75  

MAL Administrative assistant - Typed Cross Examination 1.00  

CEG Revise Trial Management Certificate 0.75  

May 21, 2025

ML Read Alyson’s emails; Update Math4Law Sworn Financial Statement 0.10  

ML Review Sworn Financial Statement and Certificate of Compliance with CEG (.2); 0.30  
Print Sworn Financial Statement and forward to Alyson for electronic signature
(.1)

ML Download updated documents provided by Charles into client file 0.25  

ML Download updated 16.2(e)(7) and 26(e) documents to Dropbox for submission to 0.25  
C. Bell

ML Organize updated statements provided by C. Bell into client’s discovery main 0.75  
file

CEG Review Sworn Financial Statement and Certificate of Compliance for filing 0.30  

CEG Initial inventory of Charles' updated disclosures 0.50  
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EMP DESCRIPTION HOURS

CEG Review new disclosures and revised Trial Management Certificate 1.30  

CEG Read pleadings and disclosures for 6/11/25 hearing 0.50  

May 22, 2025

ML Download, save, and send e-filings from Charles regarding 6/11/25 hearing. 0.25  

ML Hearing preparation with attorney. 1.50  

CEG Preparation of Response to Charles' Witness List 2.00  

CEG Meetings 1.00  

CEG Hearing preparation 2.00  

May 23, 2025

CEG Start Testimony Outline; Read Charles' Motion regarding Freedberg's April report 0.50  

May 25, 2025

CEG Revisions to Response to Witness List and Motion to Strike; Prepare Order 1.50  

CEG Hearing preparation 4.00  

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

Attorney/Glassman 104.70 hrs @ 400.00 $ 41,880.00
Administrative/LaPlume 9.10 hrs @ 65.00 $ 591.50
Paralegal/LaPlume 46.65 hrs @ 175.00 $ 8,163.75
Attorney/Milfeld 8.10 hrs @ 325.00 $ 2,632.50

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 168.55 HOURS $ 53,267.75

COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS       

DATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

09/24/24 E-filing charges 24.00

10/09/24 E-filing charges 24.00

11/20/24 E-filing charges 24.00
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DATE DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

11/26/24 Freedberg Ltd. 351.00

12/10/24 E-filing charges 12.00

12/18/24 E-filing charges 24.00

12/31/24 Freedberg Ltd. 1,755.00

03/13/25 E-filing charges 36.00

04/16/25 E-filing charges 12.00

TOTAL COSTS AND DISBURSEMENTS $  2,262.00
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